
 

 

Principal Technology Evangelist / Architect (f/m/d)  

Your duties 

• Provide technical leadership & serve as expe-
rienced technologist of the architecture team  

• Act as technical face to customers and stake-
holders on all management levels  

• Present Nagarro’s technological competencies 
and evaluate individual delivery models for 
customers 

• Inspire architecture & development teams  

• Ensure execution of technical strategies, 
guidelines and quality standards  

• Set the pace for innovation and digital  

• disruption by promoting usage of new 
technologies 

• Manage and initiate new relationships with 3rd 
party technology vendors 

• Act as change agent for customers and sparring 
partner for all CoE’s   

• Recommend & design proof of concepts and 
pilots for customers 

Your profile 

• Several years of world-class engineering 
experience with a broad range of technologies 
and enterprise architecture, ideally as a 
Consultant and with innovation and/or research 
labs background 

• Experience in agile development processes and 
quality management systems 

• Cutting-edge know-how in at least 4 of the 
following topics: Cloud, Security, Big Data & 
Analytics, Mobility, IoT & Wearables, Machine 
Learning, DevOps , Enterprise Architectures  

• Excellent overview of current industry trends 
and their impacts   

• Analytical and conceptual skills 

• Distinct Client and result orientation 

• Strong communication skills in both written and 
spoken German and English  

• Charismatic, interculturally competent and 
prepared to travel worldwide 

We offer: 

•  Exciting customers and tasks in national and international projects 

•  An international, approachable world-class Software- and Management  team in a flat organization 

•  Flexibility – for working time as well as work location, 30 days off, Sabbatical-Option 
•  Your training is important to us! – You will get best support 

 

Have we caught your attention? Let us know your personal plans! 

We look forward to hearing from you: Claudia.Gluchow@nagarro.com 

Tel. +49 89 785 000-110,    Mobil +49 178 7770721 

 

 


